From: Hepp, Christopher

To: Sullo, Dustin

CC: Jennifer Altier

Sent: 7/3/2012 11:53:29 AM

Subject: Re: Co-Pay Cards--West Region
Dustin:

Thanks from me as well.

Have a great 4th!

Chris Hepp

Actavis Pharmaceuticals, Inc.
West Region Business Director
317-997-7337

chepp@kadian. com

On Jul 3, 2012, at 11:14 AM, "Sullo,

Hi Jennifer/Chris

These shipped complete yesterday

Tracking numbers below

Erin Koschwanez 1Z964E1F0353342900
Kristi Wurgler 1Z964E1F0352089517
Lori Romer 1Z964E1F0354802125
Richard Askew 1Z964E1F0353080738
Kristie Robinson 1Z964E1F0353525347
Ben Allen 1Z964E1F0353735950

Brad Carter 1Z964E1F0354312566

Carl Balzanti 1Z964E1F1252855172
Aaron Boyle 17Z964E1F0352963787
Shelley Fitch 1Z964E1F0352238392
Adriana Knoblauh 1Z964E1F0354279004

Octavia Jones 1Z9¢4E1F0353685611

Dustin Sullo

Senior Project Manager

Dustin" <DSullo@medimedia.

com> wrote:
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Confidentiality Notice: This e-mail may contain legally privileged and/or confidential
information. If you are not the intended recipient(s) or the employee or agent responsible for
delivery of this message to the intended recipient(s), you are hereby notified that any
dissemination, distribution, or copying of this transmittal is strictly prohibited. If you
received this message in error, please immediately notify the sender and delete this message
from your computer.

From: Jennifer Altier [mailto:JALTIERGactavis.com]
Sent: Monday, July 02, 2012 6:51 AM

To: Sullo, Dustin

Cc: CHepp@inventivhealth.com

Subject: FW: Co-Pay Cards—--West Region

Dustin,

Please fulfill the order below for Kadian co-pay cards for the West region.

Thanks,

Jennifer

Jennifer Altier
Marketing Director
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Actavis

60 Columbia Rd. Bldg B t +1 908-¢72-1918 @ JALTIERGactavis.com

Morristown , NJ 07960 United States w www.actavis.com <http://www.actavis.com/>
Internal VoIP number

Please note that this e-mail and its attachments are intended for the named addressee only and
may contain information that is confidential and privileged. If you have by coincidence or
mistake or without specific authorization received this e-mail and its attachments we request
that you notify us immediately that you have received them in error, uphold strict
confidentiality and neither read, copy, nor otherwise make use of their content in any way
Please note that the sender of this e-mail and its attachments is solely responsible for its
content if it does not concern the operations of Actavis Group or its subsidiaries.

From: Hepp, Christopher [mailto:CHepp@inventivhealth.com]
Sent: Thursday, June 28, 2012 9:32 AM

To: Jennifer Altier

Subject: Co-Pay Cards—--West Region

Jennifer:
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As we discussed yesterday,
to each member of the West

Erin Koschwanez

3314 El Charro Point
Castle Rock

cO

20108
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Kristi Wurgler
12712 Burt St.
Omaha

NE

68154
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Lori Romer

¢101 Acurite Dr.
Las Vegas

NV

89130
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Richard Askew
13332 Mettler Ave.
Los Angeles

CA

900¢l

<image00%.png>

please send 100 Kadian Co-Pay cards
Region:

(10-boxes)

as soon as possible
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Kristie Robinson
9390 E. Monument Dr.
Scottsdale

AZ

85262
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Ben Allen

2195 SwW 203rd Avenue
Aloha

OR

97006
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Brad Carter

1300 East 1158 South
Salt Lake City

UT

84105
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Carl Balzanti
10 Vallecito
Foothill Ranch
CA

92¢l10
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Aaron Boyle
3701 N. Gove S3t.
Tacoma

WA
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98407
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Shelley Fitch
€954 Gallery Way
Sacramento

CA

95831
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Adriana Knoblauch
7922 Alrport Blvd.
Los Angeles

CA

90045
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Octavia Jones

479 W. Calle Monte Vista Dr.

Tempe

AZ

85284

If possible, please let me know when these cards will be shipped so I can alert my team.

Thanks for your help, and let me know if there is anything you need from me.

Thanks,

Chris Hepp

Actavis/InVentiv Health

Regional Business Director
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