From: Sullo, Dustin <DSullo@medimedia.com>

Sent: Friday, January 21, 2011 7:58 AM
To: Sullo, Dustin; Nathalie Leitch

Cc: Miller, Jeff

Subject: RE: Kadian Co-pay cards

Nathalie

Justan FYI

We have 227 Packs remaining in inventory.

Have we finalized the count for assembly on the complete kit?

Dustin Sullo | Triple i, A MediMedia USA Company 350 Starke Road | Carlstadt, NJ 07072 | Phone: (201) 231-6147 | Fax: (201) 231-6352 | email:
dsullo@medimedia.com

From: Sullo, Dustin

Sent: Friday, January 21, 2011 10:47 AM
To: Nathalie Leitch

Cc: Miller, Jeff

Subject: RE: Kadian Co-pay cards

Hi Nathalie

The backorder is cleared and the shipments to the reps went out last night
Tracking below

Tommi Lynn Tormey 1Z964E1F0153078094

Carl Balzanti 1Z964E1F0154938706

Richard Askew 1Z964E1F0154165318

Aaron Boyle 17964E1F0154357923

Kenneth Burson 1Z964E1F0153116533

Dustin Sullo | Triple i, A MediMedia USA Company 350 Starke Road | Carlstadt, NJ 07072 | Phone: (201) 231-6147 | Fax: (201) 231-6352 | email:
dsullo@medimedia.com
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From: Nathalie Leitch [mailto:NLeitch@actavis.com]
Sent: Thursday, January 20, 2011 11:41 AM

To: Sullo, Dustin

Subject: RE: Kadian Co-pay cards

Hi Dustin,

There are 5 reps who need more co-pay cards. Please send via overnight (or second day if too late today) delivery 300
cards (30 pack of 10) to each of the following reps:

Tommi Lynn Tormey
35 Dale Road East
Rochester, NY 14625

Carl Balzanti

10 Vallecito

Foothill Ranch CA 92610
Phone: 949/632-4446

Richard Askew

14418 Cobblstone Lane
Woodland Hills CA 91367
818/831-0671

Aaron Boyle

3701 N. Gove St.

Tacoma WA 98407
253/988-1555

Kenneth Burson

2620 Wingdale Drive

Charlotte NC 28213
704/921-8992

Thanks for your help with this!

Nathalie

Nathalie Leitch
Director, Specialty Rx Products

i kbt

Actavis
60 Columbia Rd. Bldg B ¢ +1 973-889-6968 (D NLeitch@actavis.com
Morristown , NJ 07960 United States w www.actavis.com

internal VoIP number t 125 6968

Please note that this e-mall and its
have by coincidence or mistake or

ttachments are intended for the named addressee only and may contain information that is confidential and privileged. If you
ithout specific authorization received this e-mail and its attachments we request that you notify us immediately that you have
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received them in error,
mail and its attachments

hold strict confidentiality and neither read, copy, nor otherwise make use of their content ir way Please note that the sender of this e-
5 solaly responsible for its content if it does not concern the operations of Actavis Group or its subsidiaries.

From: Sullo, Dustin [mailto:DSullo@medimedia.com]
Sent: Thursday, January 20, 2011 10:24 AM

To: Nathalie Leitch

Cc: Sullo, Dustin

Subject: Kadian Co-pay cards

| have them now. So | will fill the backorder and send 300 cards
To
Tommi Lynn Tormey

35 Dale Road East
Rochester, NY 14625

Dustin Sullo | Triple i, A MediMedia USA Company 350 Starke Road | Carlstadt, NJ 07072 | Phone: (201) 231-6147 | Fax: (201) 231-6352 | email:
dsullo@medimedia.com

From: Nathalie Leitch [mailto:NLeitch@actavis.com]
Sent: Wednesday, January 19, 2011 5:19 PM

To: Sullo, Dustin

Subject: RE: Co-pay cards

Yes, the 8000.
| meant to say reps.

Nathalie Leitch
Director, Specialty Rx Products

Actavis

60 Columbia Rd. Bldg B ¢ +1 973-889-6968 () NLeitch@actavis.com
Morristown , NJ 07960 United States w www.actavis.com

Internal VoIP number ¢t 125 6968

Mlease note that this e-mall and its for the named addressee only and may contair information that is confidential and privileged. If you
have by coincidence or mistake o fion received fhis e-mail and its attachmer ify us immaediately that you have
received them in error, uphold str Please note that the sender of this e-

4 Ys
mall arel it achime 5 solely responsible for ite content If it does not concern the operations of Actavis Group or its subsidiaries.

From: Sullo, Dustin [mailto:DSullo@medimedia.com]
Sent: Wednesday, January 19, 2011 5:15 PM

To: Nathalie Leitch

Subject: RE: Co-pay cards

Are you speaking of the 8000 hat you wanted us to do?

What is the res?
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Dustin Sullo | Triple i, A MediMedia USA Company 350 Starke Road | Carlstadt, NJ 07072 | Phone: (201) 231-6147 | Fax: (201) 231-6352 | email:
dsullo@medimedia.com

From: Nathalie Leitch [mailto:NLeitch@actavis.com]
Sent: Wednesday, January 19, 2011 4:47 PM

To: Sullo, Dustin

Subject: Co-pay cards

Hi Dustin,
When will this round of cards+pi’s be assembled and ready for shipping to the res?

Thanks,
Nathalie

Nathalie Leitch
Director, Specialty Rx Products

Actavis

60 Columbia Rd. Bldg B ¢ +1 973-889-6968 (i NLeitch@actavis.com
Morristown , NJ 07960 United States w www.actavis.com
Internal VolP number ¢ 125 6968

t itial ared privileged. If you
erce or mistake or wit S i d st that vou notify us immediately that vou have

1 error, upl f ny way Please note that the sender of this e-
isidiaries.
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