Message

From: Danise Yam [/O=THERANOS ORGANIZATION/OU=FIRST ADMINISTRATIVE GROUP/CN=RECIPIENTS/CN=DYAM]
Sent: 4/29/2009 6:23:59 PM

To: Carolyn Balkenhol [/o=theranaos organization/ou=first administrative group/cn=recipients/cn=cbalkenhol]
Subject: RE: Need an invoice for Schering-Plough

Danise Yam
Corporate Controller
Theranos, Inc

3200 Hillview Ave
Palo Alto, CA 94304

Tel:
Fax:

PRIVILEGED AND CONFIDENTIAL COMMUNICATION

IMPORTANT — This electronic transmission, and any files transmitted with it are confidential and/or legally privileged information. This information is

intended solely for the use of the individual or entity to which it is addressed. Any disclosure, retransmission, reproduction, dissemination or other use of
the contents of this information by persons or entities other than the intended recipient is strictly prohibited. If you have received this email in error,
please contact us immediately and delete all copies. Please note that any views or opinions presented in this email are solely those of the author and do
not necessarily represent those of Theranos, Inc. Finally, before opening or using attachments the recipient should check this email and any
attachments for the presence of viruses. Theranos, Inc. accepts no liability for any damage caused by any virus transmitted by this email. Our sole
responsibility is limited to resupplying any affected attachments.

From: Carolyn Balkenhol

Sent: Wednesday, April 29, 2009 10:57 AM
To: Danise Yam

Subject: Need an invoice for Schering-Plough

The PDF is what they currently have (and which has been approved already). | think we need to send an updated version
with corrected dates, which | have attached. The invoice date is still 4/15 (which is what was sent to S-P and approved at
that point). | have only modified the expiration of the terms and the start date.

Please prepare an invoice and send back to me.

Thanks,
Carolyn

From: Elizabeth Holmes

Sent: Wednesday, April 29, 2005 10:51 AM
To: Carolyn Balkenhol

Subject: FW: Follow up

Elizabeth Holmes
President and Chief Executive Officer
Theranos. Inc.

Tel:
Fax:
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PRIVILEGED AND CONFIDENTIAL COMMUNICATION

IMPORTANT - This electronic transmission, and any files transmitted with it are confidential and/or legally privileged information. This information is
intended solely for the use of the individual or entity to which they are addressed. Any disclosure, retransmission, reproduction, dissemination or other
use of the contents of this information by persons or entities other than the intended recipient is strictly prohibited. If you have received this email in
error, please contact us immediately and delete all copies. Please note that any views or opinions presented in this email are solely those of the author
and do not necessarily represent those of Theranos, Inc. Finally, before opening or using attachments the recipient should check this email and any
attachments for the presence of viruses. Theranos, Inc. accepts no liability for any damage caused by any virus transmitted by this email. Our sole
responsibility is limited to resupplying any affected attachments.

Theranos, Inc., 3200 Hillview Avenue, Palo Alto, CA, 94304
650-838-9292 www.theranos.com

From: Elizabeth Holmes

Sent: Wednesday, April 15, 2009 1:22 PM

To: james.mcleod @spcorp.com; Cullen, Constance
Subject: Follow up

Dear Jim,

In follow up to our discussions with Connie, we have cemented a comprehensive validation program on one of our
multiplexed cytokine panels. | have attached the invoice and program overview to this email. This invoice should work in
lieu of a contract as this analysis will be done at Theranos and the scope is restricted to validation.

We did of course work through the validation program with Connie in great detail. We will present the results of the
validation by your visit in May. We can then use that visit to discuss the data and the best ways to create value in ongoing
programs given the ability to collect higher integrity data, faster.

Talk to you soon,
Elizabeth.

Elizabeth Holmes
President and CEO
Theranos, Inc.

Tel:
Fax;

PRIVILEGED AND CONFIDENTIAL COMMUNICATION

IMPORTANT — This electronic transmission, and any files transmitted with it are confidential and/or legally privileged information. This information is
intended solely for the use of the individual or entity to which they are addressed. Any disclosure, retransmission, reproduction, dissemination or other
use of the contents of this information by persons or entities other than the intended recipient is strictly prohibited. If you have received this email in
error, please contact us immediately and delete all copies. Please note that any views or opinions presented in this email are solely those of the author
and do not necessarily represent those of Theranos, Inc. Finally, before opening or using attachments the recipient should check this email and any
attachments for the presence of viruses. Theranos, Inc. accepts no liability for any damage caused by any virus transmitted by this email. Our sole
responsibility is limited to resupplying any affected attachments.

Theranos, Inc., 3200 Hilliview Avenue, Palo Alto, CA, 94304
650-838-9252 www.theranos.com
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Theranos, Inc

3200 Hillview Avenue

theranos™

- Invoice #

SP09001

. Invoice date

April 29,2009

Palo Alto, Califomia 94304 Fuehase Orer &
Tel: (650) 838-9292 greement Date
Fax: (650) 838-9165
: Bill To: Schering-Plough Research Institute
1011 Morris Avenue
Mail Location U-13-3000
Union, New Jersey 07083
~Attn:  Jim McLeod
Early Clinical Research and Experimental Medicine
Quantity  Description Rate Amount
- Data delivery, client infrastructure and 24x7 included
- customer care support
- Distribution, trial definition/project management, included
- services configuration/software customization
- (TheranOS§), analytics, and Schering-Plough-
- specific secure back-end database and server
 infrastructure
- Set up and infrastructure, Real-time and (Laboratory $279,000
- multiplexed analysis - 2,790 multiplexed discount
- cartridges (CRP, IL-6, TNF-a) at $100 per pricing)
- cartridge ($33 per analyte including time,
- technicians, readers, and other materials)
- Use of Theranos Systems is governed by
- Theranos Terms of Service, attached to this
~ invoice.
Subtotal $279,000
PAYMENT DUE UPON RECEIPT. Late payments Sales Tax 0.00
shall incur interest at the rate of 1.5% per month Total $279,000
until paid in full. All such interest shall be due Prepayment 0.00
and payable on demand. Balance Due $279,000

Wire Transfer Instruction
Bank: Comerica Bank, 226 Airport Parkway, Suite 100 San Jose, CA 95110
Routing Number: Account Number:

Swift code:

All costs described herein are in U.S. currency. Payments made to THERANOS will be made in U.S.

currency.

These payment terms expire May 1, 2009, if this agreement is not executed in full by that date.

THERANOS CONFIDENTIAL
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